
How to Travel Between Abuja and Kaduna,
Nigeria

Abuja, the capital city of Nigeria, and Kaduna, a major city in the north-
central part of the country, are two important destinations for business and
tourism. Traveling between these two cities is relatively easy and
convenient, with several transportation options available. In this
comprehensive guide, we will provide detailed information on how to travel
between Abuja and Kaduna, including the available transportation options,
travel times, costs, and safety tips to ensure a smooth and enjoyable
journey.

Transportation Options

1. Bus
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Traveling by bus is the most common and affordable option for getting
between Abuja and Kaduna. There are several bus companies that operate
regular services on this route, including:

God is Good Motors (GIGM)

ABC Transport

Chisco Transport

Peace Mass Transit

Buses depart from various bus terminals in Abuja, such as Jabi Motor Park,
Utako Motor Park, and Nyanya Motor Park. The journey takes
approximately 3-4 hours, depending on traffic conditions. Bus fares range
from 2,500 NGN to 4,000 NGN.

2. Train

The Nigerian Railway Corporation (NRC) operates a daily train service
between Abuja and Kaduna. The train journey takes approximately 2-3
hours, making it a faster option than bus travel. Train fares range from
3,000 NGN to 6,000 NGN, depending on the class of travel.

The train departs from Idu Railway Station in Abuja and arrives at Rigasa
Railway Station in Kaduna. It is important to note that train tickets must be
booked in advance, as they tend to sell out quickly.

3. Flight
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Flying is the fastest and most expensive way to travel between Abuja and
Kaduna. Arik Air and Aero Contractors operate daily flights between
Nnamdi Azikiwe International Airport (ABV) in Abuja and Kaduna
International Airport (KAD).

The flight takes approximately 45 minutes, and fares range from 25,000
NGN to 50,000 NGN, depending on the airline and travel dates.

4. Private Car

If you prefer more privacy and flexibility, you can rent a car and drive
between Abuja and Kaduna. The distance between the two cities is
approximately 190 kilometers (120 miles),and the journey takes around 2-3
hours, depending on traffic conditions.

Several car rental companies operate in Abuja, and you can choose from a
range of vehicles to suit your needs.

Travel Times

Bus: 3-4 hours

Train: 2-3 hours

Flight: 45 minutes

Private Car: 2-3 hours

Costs

Bus: 2,500 NGN - 4,000 NGN



Train: 3,000 NGN - 6,000 NGN

Flight: 25,000 NGN - 50,000 NGN

Private Car: Rental costs vary depending on the car type and rental
company.

Safety Tips

Always be aware of your surroundings and be cautious of strangers.

When traveling by bus, choose reputable companies and avoid
traveling at night.

If you are taking a train, make sure to book your tickets in advance and
arrive at the station early.

If you are driving, be aware of the road conditions and obey traffic
regulations.

Avoid carrying large amounts of cash or valuables with you.

Inform someone about your travel plans and expected arrival time.

Traveling between Abuja and Kaduna, Nigeria, is relatively easy and
convenient, with several transportation options available to suit your needs
and budget. Whether you prefer the affordability of bus travel, the speed of
train or air travel, or the privacy and flexibility of driving yourself, there is an
option to meet your requirements. By following the safety tips outlined in



this guide, you can ensure a smooth and enjoyable journey between these
two important Nigerian cities.
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